TOWN COUNCIL AGENDA
December 9, 2019
7:00 P.M.

The Town Council meeting will be held in the Moose Hill Council Chambers, Town
Hall, 268B Mammoth Road, Londonderry, NH. Regular meetings are cablecast live
and videotaped for the convenience of our viewers at home. 7:00 PM.

A CALL TO ORDER

B. PUBLIC COMMENT

C. PUBLIC HEARING

1.) Resolution #2019-10 — A Resolution Relative to the Release of
a Portion of the Constance Drive Right-Of-Way
Presented by Colleen Mailloux

2.) Resolution #2019-09 — A Resolution Relative to the
Discontinuance of a Portion of Constance Drive Right-Of-Way
Presented by Colleen Mailloux

3.) Ordinance #2019-07 — An Amendment to Section 5.15 of the
Londonderry Zoning Ordinance Relating to Portable Structures
Presented by Richard Canuel and Colleen Mailloux

4.) Ordinance #2019-08 — AN Amendment to Londonderry Zoning
Ordinance, Building Code Amendments, Section 9 Reflecting

the Adoption of the 2015 Editions of the International Codes
Presented by Richard Canuel

5.) Fiscal Year 2021 Budget Public Hearing

D. OLD BUSINESS

1.) Budget Workshop

E. NEW BUSINESS

1.) Resolution #2019-11 — A Resolution Relative to Creating the
Taxpayer Relief Act of 2020
Presented by Kevin Smith

F. APPROVAL OF MINUTES

Approval of November 25, 2019 Town Council Minutes



APPOINTMENTS/REAPPOINTMENTS

NOTE: Appointments will be considered at the December 16"
meeting.

OTHER BUSINESS

1. Liaison Reports
2. Town Manager Report
3. Assistant Town Manager Report

ADJOURNMENT

MEETING SCHEDULE

A. Town Council Meeting — 12/16/19 Moose Hill Council
Chambers, 7:00PM

B. Town Council Meeting — 01/06/20 Moose Hill Council
Chambers, 7:00PM

C. Town Council Meeting — 01/20/20 Moose Hill Council
Chambers, 7:00PM

D. Town Council Meeting — 02/03/20 Moose Hill Council
Chambers, 7:00PM



LEGAL NOTICE
The Londonderry Town Council will hold PUBLIC HEARINGS on the following items:

Resolution #2019-10 — A Resolution Relative to the Release of a Portion of the
Constance Drive Right-Of-Way

Resolution #2019-09 — A Resolution Relative to the Discontinuance of a Portion of
Constance Drive Right-Of-Way

Ordinance #2019-07 — An Amendment to Section 5.15 of the Londonderry Zoning
Ordinance Relating to Portable Structures

Ordinance #2019-08 — AN Amendment to Londonderry Zoning Ordinance,
Building Code Amendments, Section 9 Reflecting the Adoption of the 2015 Editions
of the International Codes

The Public Hearings are scheduled for Monday, December 9, 2019 at 7:00 PM at the
Londonderry Town Hall, 268B Mammoth Road, Londonderry, NH 03053.

Londonderry Town Council



RESOLUTION 2019-10

A Resolution Relative to the

RELEASE OF A PORTION OF THE CONSTANCE DRIVE

RIGHT-OF-WAY

WHEREAS

WHEREAS

WHEREAS

WHEREAS

First Reading: 11/25/2019
Second Reading: 12/09/2019
Adopted: 12/16/2019

NH RSA 41:14-a grants authority to municipalitics to acquire or sell land,
buildings, or both; provided, however, they shall first submit any such
proposed acquisition or sale to the planning board and to the conservation
commission for review and recommendation by those bodies, where a board
or commission or both, exist;

the Planning Board and the Conservation Commission both reviewed and
recommended release of land known as a portion of the Constance Drive
Right-of-Way marked “R.O.W. for Future Extension” on a subdivision plan
entitled “Map 6, Parcel 59 Subdivision Plan prepared for Jean M. Gagnon,”
scale: 1°=50", prepared by Donald C. Jenks, LLS, dated January 28, 1986,
and approved by the Planning Board on March 30, 1988, comprising
approximately 11,000 square feet, and running from the end of the cul-de-
sac to the property line with Lot 6-59-1 (30 Cross Road) (the “Subject
Property”);

the Town Council has determined after a public hearing that the Subject
Property is no longer feasible as a future extension of Constance Drive and
offers no public benefit to the Town, and has voted for its discontinuance;
and

the Town Council received the favorable recommendations of both the
Planning Board and the Conservation Commission, held two public
hearings at least 10 but not more than 14 days apart on the proposed release
of land, and determined that the Subject Property shall be released to the
two abutting lots known as 7 Constance Drive (Map 6 Lot 59-13) and 14
Constance Drive (Map 6 Lot 59-12) in equal or nearly equal portions upon
Planning Board approval of a lot line adjustment plan.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Londondetry Town Council has voted
to affirmatively quitclaim and release the Subject Property 1o the two abutting lots known as 7
Constance Drive (Map 6 Lot 59-13) and 14 Constance Drive (Map 6 Lot 59-12) in equal or nearly
equal portions upon Planning Board approval of a lot line adjustment plan.

John Farrell - Chairman
Town Council



(TOWN SEAL)

Sharon Farrell - Town Clerk
A TRUE COPY ATTEST:
12/16/2019



STAFF RECOMMENDATION

To: Planning Board Date: November 6, 2019
From: Colleen P. Mailloux, AICP, Town Planner

Application: Review and recommendation of the Planning Board pursuant to RSA 41:14-a of
a request for the release of town property; a portion of the Constance Drive
Right-of-Way consisting of approximately 11,000 square feet, adjacent to 7
Constance Drive and 14 Constance Drive

In 1988, the Planning Board approved a subdivision creating Constance Drive, off Cross Road.
At that time, a Right of Way was reserved for future extension of Constance Drive through to
the abutting parcel, and cul de sac easements were provided over Lots 6-59-13 and Lots 6-59-
12, which were intended to be discontinued when a through road was constructed. Constance
Drive {including the ROW reserved for future extension) was then deed to the Town.

Due to the configuration of the abutting Cross Farm Development, and wetlands present on
that site beyond the existing dedicated Right of Way, there are no plans currently, or in the
future, to construct a Constance Drive extension.

The owners of the abutting parcels, 7 Constance Drive (Map 6, Lot 59-13) and 14 Constance
Drive (Map 6, Lot 59-12) are requesting that the Constance Drive Right of Way be extinguished,
and that the underlying land (approximately 11,000 square feet) be split and transferred to the
properties on either side of the ROW.

This is a multi-step process which requires approval of the property release by the Town
Council (after review and recommendation by the Planning Board and Conservation
Commission in accordance with RSA 41:14a), discontinuance of the public right of way, and a
subsequent lot line adjustment to be reviewed and approved by the Planning Board to adjust
the property lines of parcels 59-12 and 59-13.

The Planning Board should review the Applicant’s request and make a recommendation to the
Town Council regarding the release of the 11,000 square foot section of the Constance
Driveway Right of Way to the abutting property owners.

e Recommendation: Staff recommends that the Planning Board recommend that the
Town Council authorize the transfer of this parcel to the abutting property owners as
there are no future plans for extension of Constance Drive.

Board Action Required: Motion to recommend to the Town Council that the parcel be
transferred to the abutting property owners, with the condition that a lot line
adjustment plan be submitted for review and approval by the Planning Board.




Kevin Smith
Londonderry Town Manager

30-September-2019

Dear Mr. Smith,

| am writing to you in regards to the right-of-way between two properties on Constance Drive. The two
properties are the Ward property (006 059 12) 14 Constance Drive and the Peterson property (006 059
13} 7 Constance Drive.

We would like to request discontinuance of the right-of-way and transfer of the underlying land to the
abutting properties.

Thank you,

]

Joseph & Rebekah Ward

&R ey
> AebAlsfl

_——Michag] & Kathleen Peter;on_

R EVIVS SN




Town of Londonderry, NH

September 21, 2019

Ward-Peterson ROW

Qo6 059 11 { ;

o

OhE 05912

006 05913

TRUST

MAP FOR REFERENCE ONLY
NOT A LEGAL DOCUMENT
Town of Londonderry, NH makes no claims and no warranyies,

pxpressed or implied, concerning Ihe validity or accuracy of
the GIS dala presented on this map.

Geomelry updaled 05/11/2018
Data updated 06/05/2010

4
/
/
.r"/;z% V4
] fal d
£
. } 3 o A (5 8]
[ne <l o
L ° e
LG /“Cf.\ o © L~
0O b
(WY L o .
q‘& -r C) F‘
l et gLy
o>
1"=122 1t
Property information
Property 006 05913
D
Logation 7 CONSTANCE DR
Owner PETERSON MICHAEL+KATHLEEN FAMILY




‘\ 127 8y ZErT TS [ T T SO RIS
™ kwavow

DRI K B OTNOT G S BT 09 il Sy o) ——
ST S T A7 AT e B \ | .ur..ﬁsﬂuﬂo w&c@\n\&m@ e
" - e Q‘Qﬂﬂdi 0 ST ST
*y " _ 3957 ARV 1ot A AT
5 s | |
B Tz VT O35,/ TIEIS M 3 _ ! o
2 1AL % o { s
KN ASXTONOTNO Y 508 M !
R P it
X g I ,_ O | 1mmwxu& -
. = KA A e ! e pearrir “ OBy e s
& 3 h AT TS L idets 67 o R/ 77) R
NONIV'D W N 4 SO e, | ey & S5
] R i Tinet S k NITXEY P LNy % . —
MYV NOIGIAITES § CQ ! i 4 ! a0 =
) i > S v
Y 66 TN PSP} % i [ ) Y & =
. N T T T o) -
o B s D s syt : ~—
S . el B ] 5,
3 SINW ELT = . 3 i
iy AV , A Fra
. L6658 =N . ; .
: L . 3
SIS0 LLF FREY
mlﬁ l% / / e 2.6#!}
TSI
% L)
L IR
L
. — A
T F 1
G A
s~ A
B
Uy... g /M
2L £
ol A G ) QYA T .m&\ ) \ 5 .“ N \x
2y Qg bt th0 P“\lmhv -9’ /.n - /#u.
PEEE R 2 -~ e
%
e sy ~ - %
S Powed Sves \ / ~ 7 %
SIS Byt Aaifbifiorl \
W I S - O LD DABIDII PSS L\ MR ATIALL I ETY h\.‘h«“‘.
Beg A FESS & \.@“E«Mn. k}}\“ﬁﬂw‘eﬁ\\e\nsx&w > ‘,z\.&\ - .n\\\,\uw\.v?\ ¥
S Lo sl i AT AL b AT DEGY (7 N 2 i v e \
Garey s s ansseni o T I 25"
AL A R N i 5 B ) SERAD P AN o 3 :
A i 0 A GERITONT T 2 LY LG £ f AN 9 GERT [ PR \
SV TS TINTIT ST il N
AN TSR AL J LA G JIANRZS K G A B YR (F @D 3w
s sy iy i U@F Y
FRLTT Dt 3 7ot PG AE TS J ORI TED LN G SRS SR 1 A
BAIID D B DD LN AT G B 281 [l
T AL OO WY, D HO LI NI AT | ia
BRI P \E\Kv\asn\xm \..MW!@ \mn ﬁ%\h e 3 al I3 «
2118 AR G PORD 0 S L . . ;
AR 4000 AP 3 I 8 10530 AR 20 AL (T 313 ST LSS m_m . \
S HHI 2 T -
U i ' N
s
T
4 e
aor L2 sreas ST XTI A ITE
~ W T NOLLYIOT a\\%%&
) a2 ety
vl » oo 7 omiiary
. e il I B o AL T FIIITI 9 FOTF FAIZ TR F WLt ARAKTE
i &ﬁi&l\ﬂ. ﬁnu.\i.\ e ..PMH o v OISR A2 T T PN 0L AL A CUTED ABTLIN
; ; o e p
: e TE i i 2 NOUENTLITI
A SO i W OOTFOT qu.wuh. 4
4 AL 55"
) T Ly 5
~ i s \Mn. o ML AP DUET 0 ML K K IO DD 1f FESIHIED
m (e s O S AT D0 G0 24y it PRACRIA PG O Y
? R/ CENOISIATS




|

Wil Sz fH'Y

L eafmmen s o ke et e

0034815

a
-
b

"

ROCKINGHAN COUNTY
EEGISTRY OF DEEDS

e e S e i e Lt e W e mem— L —

| ARRRANTY DEED B3227 Piddyg

"KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, That Jean M. Gagnon, of
184 Rockingham Road, Londonderry, Cournl of Rockingham, State of
Hew Hampshire, for consideration paid, grants tod

TOWN OF LONDONDERRY, LONDOWDERRY, CRUNTY OF Roﬂﬂlﬂﬁlﬁﬁf
STATE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE, /s« % ‘Ec-..i,cm{ﬂ ,.,.A;:w‘r;x

wilith WARRAKTY COVEHANTS:

n certain tract of land in the Town of Londonderry, County
of Rockimgham,State of New Hampshire bounhded ape described as
Tolliows:

Beginning zt & granibte béund set &n the westerly pldallne
of Cross Road,said bound marking the southeasterly corner of
Constance Drivep

Thepee along the sve of & curve to the laft 39,277 {sakd
curve havine a radius of 29,00') to & granite bound sct on tha
goutherly sideline of Conatance prive at a polnt of tangencys

Therce along said southerly sideline soutl G0°=58"=25"
Neat~ 286.29" tc an iron pipe sel ab & point of curvaturs, §

Thence along the arc of a curve to the left L1E.67' f{said
curve having a radius of 175.00') to a granice bound set on

the southerly sidelins of Constance Lrive at a point of tangency:

Therice along sald southerly sideline seuth 247-241 -S0"west
212.00° %o a granlte bound set ab a polnt af curvaktuarer

Thence along the are of 2 curve to the left 201,12 lzaid
cuopve having s radivs of 175,006 to & grenite bound set on the
gasteriy gideline of Constance Grive at & polnk of tapgencyi

~ Thence along said easterly sideline south 42°-05'-20" Bast
190,00 to & granite bound set at & polnt of curvaburef

Thence along the ate of a cuyve to the right 74,900 (cald
curve having & radius of 225.00°) to a granite beund set on the
aoutherly sldeline of Constance Drive af a point of tangency:

Thence along sald southerly sideline southn 27°=54"' =40 " west
715 . 607 ro a 1/2% dimmeter rebar set in the canterline of a
stonawatl;

Meonme pmoreh A2%-50-20" weat 520210 oalong = ctanewsll Lo
a2 drill hole set in the centerline of a stonewall;:

~ Thence along the northerly sideline of Comstance Drive north
37954140 sast 217.40' to 8 granite bound set at a point of
curvature;

PR

ST M S

ST S ST TR A e

B



P —

B3227 P1450

Thence aleng the arc of a gurve to the left 213.60° (said curve
having & rvadivg of 175.00') to o granite bowund set on the westerly
aideline of Constance Drive at a point of tapgency: = .

Thence along sald westerly sideline north 43°=05°-20" west
100.006° to a granite bound set at pelnk of curvature;

Thence aleng the are of a curve to the right 261.15' (said
curve having & radins of 225.00') to a granlte bound set on the
noreherly aidetine of Constance Drive, at a polat of tangency;

Thence along the northerly sldeline of Constance Drive noarth
94°=24°~50" esst 212.00' to & granite bound seb at a polnt of cupvaturer

Thence aleng the ate of a curve to the right 143.57" (said
curve having & radiue of 225.00') te an iren pipe #et on the
portherly sldetine of Constance prive, st a polnt of tangency:

thence aleng the norktherily sideline of Constamce Drive norkh
60°-58'-25" east 287.00' to & granite hound set at i point af ocurvatuve;

PThance along the are of a curve to the left 38,330 lsald copen
having a radlus of 25.00') to a granite bound set on the weaterly
wideline of Crosa foad, said bound mir<ing the mortheasterly corner
of Constancs Drive:

Thenrce along the arc of a curve to the left 34.75' {sald curve
having & radivs of 875.00°%%F tC & point on the westerly gideline of
Cruss Road:

rhence contiming akong the wenterly sideline of Cross Road
soukh 297-01%-35" east -64.27' to the point of beginning.

Mesning and intending to describe Constance Drive &5 showh
pa'Map & Parcel $9- Subdivision Plan propared for Joah M. Gagnon
in Londonderry, N.H.," — scale 1% = 50'; dated January 28, 1986
and prepared by Donald C. Jenks LLb., 80 Perking Rowad, Londonderry
M., , recorded R.C.R.D, as Plan D=18410. Theve Lo further conveyed
bo the Tawn of bondondsrry an eszement for the purpose of maintaining
the Blope andfor drailnage easemznls appurtenant to the above roadway (&)
over the lotisl as shown on the above plan.

There ls alse conveyed an easement over the tomporary cul=de=nac {5}
as show on the sbove plan for the purpose of malntaining saiﬂ_cul-dgfsgqtaﬁ
Sald sasement Will revert to the owner ol tha Lok (2% gt the time the .
above rosdwayis] iz oxtended. ' ! S SO R

Bleo meaning to describe a portien of the premlses conveyed to
Jean M. Cagqnon by deed of Kathrvn C'Donnell dated May 17, 1964 and
recarded Vol. 2491 Page 1164 R.C-R.D.; reserving bey the Tenpesseds
Gas Transwission Co, any rights or eagements described in Yol. 1329
Pg. 6& R, C.R.D.




!
!
|
|
i

‘ t ; L3
5 ." ‘;EE’ - 1'-__ g
hjf’Q»: ;g g;g
STALE OF NEW HAMPSHIRE: 2o vy fif
COUNTY OF ROCKINGHAM: AR

B3R27 P1451
ODRTED this 29th day of December, LSEB9.

ifaean M, Gagnon
-

‘P“cﬂvua“ s
’i

e
g
e foregolng inatrument was acknowledged befdre’ B e .~
ghis 29th day of Degember, 1989,

jﬁﬁi4££ipu:ﬁ 4L5£¢ﬁLﬁ$¢,

nctsrg public

9=g7-195%

B



192
193
194
195
196
197
198
199
200
201
202
203
204
205
206
207
208
209
210
211
212
213
214
215
216
217
218
219
220
221
222
223
224
225
226
227
228
2729
230
231
232
233
234
235
230
237
238
239

Planning Board Meeting
Wednesday 11/6/19 -DRAFT Page 5 of 12

forward, and therefore, the local regulations should be updated accordingly to
reflect the proper codes. He said there is no new information or new requirements
in the current regulations. M. Soares asked where a resident could read the 2015
edition of the international codes. R. Canuel told her that it is not available online,
but they can come to his department to read it as they have it there.

Chairman Rugg opened it up to the public for input, and there was none.

Member M. Soares made a motion to recommend the amended
changes to the Londonderry Zoning Ordinance, Building Code
Amendments, Section 9 reflect the adoption of the 2015 editions of
the international codes as promulgated by the New Hampshire State
Building Code to the Town Council.

T. Combes seconded the motion.

The motion was granted 7-0-0. The Chair voted in the affirmative.

IV. New Plans/Public Hearings

A. Review and recommendation of the Planning Board pursuant to RSA
41:14-a of a request for the release of Town Property; a portion of the
Constance Drive Right-of-Way of approximately 11,000 square feet,
adjacent to 7 Constance Drive and 14 Constance Drive

Chairman Rugg read the case into the record. Town Planner Mailloux gave the
Board some background information on how this right-of-way was created when the
subdivision was approved for Constance Drive. She explained that the right-of-way
was deeded to the Town through a warranty deed, which included a future right-of-
way extension beyond the end of the existing cul-de-sac as that was the practice at
that time. She pointed out that due to the wetlands on the property there is no
potential from the Cross Farm development for access. She said that the abutting
property owners at 7 Constance Drive and 14 Constance Drive are requesting this
11,000 SF of land be transferred to them. She reviewed the procedure under RSA
41:14a that before the Town Council can authorize the transfer of town property,
this needs to go before the Planning Board and Conservation Commission. She
noted that it is a multiple step process, as there needs to be a property transfer,
discontinuance of the right-of-way and a lot line adjustment. She said that this
would be the first step in the process. A. Chiampa asked when the Conservation
Commission would hear this. Town Planner Mailloux said the Conservation
Commission would hear this next week. T. Combes asked why this was planned for
in the first place, if there are so many wetlands that would prohibit it. Town Planner
Mailloux noted that this was done over 30 years ago and this was common practice
with cul-de-sacs at that time and the wetlands might not have been delineated.

Chairman Rugg opened it up to the public and there was none.



240
241
242
243
244
245
246
247
248
249
250
251
252
253
254
255
256
257
258
259
260
261
262
263
2064
265
266
267
268
269
270
271
272
273
274
2715
276
277
278
279
280
281
282
283
284
285
286
287

Planning Board Meeting
Wednesday 11/6/19 -DRAFT Page 6 of 12

M. Soares made a motion to recommend to the Town Council that the
parcel be transferred to the abutting property owners, with the
condition that a lot line adjustment plan be submitted for review and
approval by the Planning Board.

A. Sypek seconded the motion.
The motion was granted 7-0-0. The Chair voted in the affirmative.

B. Public hearing on a waiver request to Section 6.01.c of the Londonderry
Site Plan Regulations to allow the issuance of a certificate of occupancy prior
to the placement of the final wearing course for a previously approved site
plan for the construction of a 9,560 SF manufacturing addition, parking lot
expansion, and associated site improvements, Nine Ricker Avenue, Map 28
Lot 22-28, Zoned IND-II, Idlewild Realty, LLC (Owner & Applicant)
conditionally approved by the Planning Board on June 5, 2019

Chairman Rugg read the case into the record. J. Trottier reviewed the background
information of the site noting this was conditionally approved by the Board on June
5, 2019, the site plan was signed on August 14, 2019 and is currently under
construction. He explained that it is anticipated that construction will be completed
this winter; however, due to the winter conditions the final wearing course of
pavement will not be able to be placed until the spring. He reviewed the waiver
request with the Board. He said that Staff recommends that the Planning Board
grant the waiver with the following conditions:

1. Appropriate financial guarantee is provided prior to the issuance of a CO to the
satisfaction of the Department of Public Works to ensure installation of the wearing
course of pavement and final pavement markings.

2. All other required improvements shall be completed prior to the issuance of a
CO, except for landscaping as permitted by the regulations.

Chairman Rugg opened it up to the public for input, and there was none.
M. Soares made a motion to approve the applicant’s request for the
above waivers to the Site Plan Regulations as outlined in Staff’s
recommendation memorandum dated November 6, 2019.
T. Combes seconded the motion.
The motion was granted 7-0-0. The Chair voted in the affirmative.
C. Application for formal review of a subdivision plan to subdivide one lot into

two, 17 Bancroft Road, Map 12 Lot 48, Zoned AR-1, Jillian S. Natale &
Randolph M. Allaire (Owners & Applicants)



36
37
38
39
40
41

42

57
58
59
60
6l
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71

Londonderry Conservation Commission
Tuesday, November 12, 2019
Minutes
Chief and Town Manager about this. D Lievens said that the Commission should follow up on his

concerns regarding noise level in the Musquash and how it could affect the wildlife. M Badois gave her
opinion as a realtor, that the neighborhoods around the Musquash are affected by the noise when
trying to sell property in the area. M Speltz asked R Olsen what other suggestions he might propose for
this issue. R Olsen suggested that the Police Department have an indoor shooting range and suggested
this might be a warrant article on the ballot. He said he could approach Fish & Game to ask them to be a
good neighbor and see if they can do more things to block the noise. M Speltz told him that the Police
Department invested a lot into the current range and thought they would not want to change it. He
asked R Olsen which shooting range was louder. R Olsen responded that he felt Fish & Game accounted
for 80% of the noise and the Police Department accounted for 20%. He said in his opinion, he believes
that people are afraid when they hear the shooting in the woods and would discourage people from
going into Musquash. M Speltz asked if limiting the hours when people can shoot at the ranges would be
help with the noise. R Olsen said that he thinks this might be difficult to limit the hours of these ranges.
B Maxwell talked about the noise ordinance in the town regulations and asked if this applies to the
shooting ranges. R Olsen quoted New Hampshire state law stating “outdoor shooting ranges cannot be
held civilly or criminally liable for noise pollution, no matter how loud.” M Speltz asked if it the issue was
the decibel or frequency of the noise. R Olsen said it is both, especially the Tannerite use. B Maxwell said
that most shooting ranges do not allow Tannerite. He commented that he recently was in the Musquash
and had an experience where there was a massive explosion that shook the ground where it happened
to be Continental paving blasting. M Speltz said that he would like to ask Fish & Game if animals possibly
acclimate to the noise. D Lievens said that she would follow up with Fish & Game for the Commission.

Constance Drive ROW discontinuance/Property release - Map 6, Lots 59-13 and 59-12: Joe Ward from
14 Constance Drive and Mike Peterson, from 7 Constance Drive introduced themselves to the
Commission stating that they are requesting the discontinuance of the right-of-way between their
property. | Ward reviewed the parcel with the Commission stating that there are wetlands in the right-
of-way and Cross Farm has decided not use this as an entrance. He noted that the Planning Board has
recommended the right-of-way discontinuance to go the Town Council. Mike Peterson reviewed the
parcel noting where Cross Farm had placed the conservation yellow signs to delineate the wetlands. M
Badois asked if the Commission would need access to monitor the easement. A Kizak said that the
Commission would be granted access through Cross Farm. M Speltz asked if Cross Farm had combined
their parcels. A Kizak responded that is correct and reviewed the access with the Commission. G
Harrington pointed out that when the lots are subdivided, the property owners will be subject to the
buffer ordinance, which they are not currently. M Badois asked if someone could draw the fifty foot
buffer on a map for them. A Kizak said when the properties go through the lot line adjustment a wetland
scientist will delineate this out in the field and the appropriate conservation buffer signs will be placed.
M Byerly made a motion to recommend to the Town Council that the parcel be transferred to the



72
73

74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86
87
88
89
S0
91
92
93
94
95
96
97
98
99
100
101
102

103
104
105
106

Londonderry Conservation Commission
Tuesday, November 12, 2019
Minutes
abutting property owners, with the condition that a lot line adjustment plan be submitted for review

and approval by the Planning Board. D Lievens seconded the motion. The mation passed, 6-1-0.

DRC - Lot 001 074 0 - 53 Chase Road Condo Conversion: Eric Mitcheil addressed the Commission
stating that the lot has existed for many decades and a recently a house was taken down and a duplex
was built, which will be converted into a condominium. E Mitchell reviewed the parcel with the
Commission noting the trees that had been cut and where the buffer is now. He said if they are required
to place conservation buffer signs, they would like to place them at the edge of the trees so there would
be no more cutting. D Lievens asked if the duplex could have been placed in a different place. E Mitchell
said that the duplex was built where the existing house was. M Badois asked if this lot falls under the
current buffer ordinance. A Kizak said that condominium conversions are exempt from complying with
the buffer ordinance if no updates are proposed. M Speltz read from the CO ordinance “Subdivisions
and Site Plans approved by the Planning Board and existing at the time of passage of the Section 4.6.1
shall be exempt from Section 4.6.1, as governed by the provisions of NH RSA § 674:39. This ordinance
becomes applicable in the following situations: A, Non-residential site plans for additions, expansions, or
changes in use. B. Site plans for new commercial, industrial, or multi-family development. C. New
subdivisions. (Condominium Conversions where there are no improvements proposed to a site are
exempt from Section 4.6.1).” M Byerly stated in his opinion, he thinks they are skirting the issue, with
first building a duplex and now doing a condo conversion. A Kizak explained that the CO district does not
apply here as the house was built before the ordinance came into existence. M Speltz commented that
he believes there should be a legislative fix on this issue before it gets out of hand. E Mitchell pointed
out that the trees were cut before the ordinance was in effect he does not believe the applicant is trying
to skirt any issue. M Badois said that if the ordinance does apply, signs would be required, E Mitchell
stated that a condominium conversion in Londonderry is treated as a subdivision and the lawn area in
the back, which existed before the ordinance was put into place, is still there. M Speltz suggested that
the Planning Board recommend the applicant to require the CO buffer signs as the spirit of the
ordinance requires the signs with construction on the property. M Nocne stated his second
recommendation would be to place the signs at the tree line. M Badcis commented that the
Commission recommends CO buffer signs along the buffer line, despite the fact that a strict reading of
the ordinance, Section 4.6.1.7.c., might not place the COD restrictions on this parcel, The Commission
noted that there were significant improvements to this site just before conversion. The Commission
commented that alternatively the CO signs must be placed on the tree line.

Amended Dredge & Fill - Lot 014 045 0- 46 Petttengill Road: A Kizak presented the amended dredge
and fill to the Commission. M Badois said the Commission approved this on June 11, 2019. M Byerly
read from the amended dredge and fill to the Commission. D Lievens said she believed this to be more
academic than anything else. M Badois agreed. The Commission had no other comments.



RESOLUTION 2019-09

A Resolution Relative 1o the
DISCONTINUANCE OF A PORTION OF THE CONSTANCE DRIVE

RIGHT-OF-WAY

First Reading: 11/25/2019
Second Reading: 12/09/2019
Adopted: 12/16/2019

WHEREAS NH RSA 231:41 permits municipalities to fix the length of time and
conditions under which rights-of-way may be used and to order the same to
be closed or discontinued when in their judgment it is necessary,

WHEREAS the Town Council is acting under such authority, and is acting as the local
legislative body under Article 3.12 of the Town Charter; and

WHEREAS the Town Council has determined after a public hearing that the portion of
the Constance Drive Right-of-Way marked “R.0.W. for Future Extension™
on a subdivision plan entitled “Map 6, Parcel 59 Subdivision Plan prepared
for Jean M. Gagnon,” scale: 1’=50", prepared by Donald C. Jenks, LLS,
dated January 28, 1986, and approved by the Planning Board on March 30,
1988, comprising approximately 11,000 square feet, and running from the
end of the cul-de-sac to the property line with Lot 6-59-1 (30 Cross Road)
(the “Right-of-Way”) is no longer feasible as a future extension of
Constance Drive and offers no public benefit to the Town.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Londonderry Town Council has voted

affirmatively to discontinue absolutely and forever the Right-of-Way identified above.

John Farrell - Chairman
Town Council

(TOWN SEAL)

Sharon Farrell - Town Clerk
A TRUE COPY ATTEST:

12/16/2019



Introduced: 11/25/19
Public Hearing: 12/09/19
Adopted: 12/09/19

ORDINANCE 2019-07
AN AMENDMENT TO SECTION 5.15 OF THE
LONDONDERRY ZONING ORDINANCE RELATING 10
PORTABLE STRUCTURES

WHEREAS it was determined that changes were necessary to address issues of
location and duration of portable structures throughout the Town; and

WHEREAS Town Staff have prepared amendments to address those issue; and
WHEREAS the Planning Board has voted to recommend Town Council adoption of

the proposed amendments;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED by the Town Council of the Town of

Londonderry that Section 5.15 of the Zoning Ordinance shall be amended as posted.

To become effective upon passage of this Ordinance.

John Farrell, Chairman
Londonderry Town Council

A TRUE COPY ATTEST:

Town Seal

Sherry Farrell - Town Clerk
12/09/2019



5.15 Portable Storage Structures

5.15.1 Portable Storage Structures in the AR-I District

The use of portable storage structures are allowed in the AR-1 District under the following conditions:

A

There must be no more than one portable storage structure per property_unless otherwise
approved as part of a non-residential site plan.

The portable storage structure must be no larger than ten feet wide, twenty-forty feet long, and
10 feet high.

A portable storage structure shall not remain at any property in excess of 6 consecutive months

unless otherwise approved as part of a site planin-any—ecalendar-year, A-building-permit-is
requiredfor placement ofa-portable sterage structure-on-aproperty-The Permitforaportable
steragestructure 6 month period may be extended-upen-apprevaigranted a one-time extension
by the Building Department when an applicant demonstrates a reasonable hardship
necessitating the extension. Such extension_request shall be made in writing to the Building

Department-and-ifgranted-shall-netresultin-any-additionalpermittees,

The portable storage structure shall be set back a minimum of 15 feet from any side or rear lot
lines, and 40 feet from any front property line.

The portable storage structure shall be set back a minimum of five feet from the nearest wall of
a building.

The portable storage structure shall be required to be placed on a paved, concrete, other
appropriate impervious surface, or be placed on blocks.

Portable storage structures associated with construction at a property where a building permit
has been issued are permitted for the duration of construction activities on the property and
shall be removed from the property within fourteen days of the issuance of a certificate of
occupancy. Portable storage structures associated with construction are exempt from Sections
5.15.1(A) through 5.15.1(F)

5.15.2 Portable Storage Structures in Commercial Districts

The use of portable storage structures are allowed in the Commercial Districts under the following

conditions:

A. There must be no more than one portable storage structure per property_unless otherwise
approved as part of a site plan-

B. The portable storage structure must be no larger than ten feet wide, twenty-forty feet long and
10 feet high.

C.

A portable storage structure shall not remain at any property in excess of 45-consecutive-days
six (6) consecutive monthsand-shal-notbeplaced-on-any-ohe-Property-H-exeess-er3o-aaysin
any-ealendaryear unless otherwise approved as part of a Site Plan, A buildingpermitisrequired

Zaning Ordinance, Town of Londonderry, NH - 7/22/18 Draft Page 136



The portable storage structure shall be set back a minimum of 30 feet from any side or rea;r lot
lines, and 60 feet from any front property line,

The portable storage structure shall be set back a minimum of five feet from the nearest wall of
a building.

The portable storage structure shall be required to be placed on a paved, concrete, other
appropriate impervious surface, or be placed on blocks, and shall not obstruct any required
parking spaces on the site.

Portable storage structures associated with construction at a property where a building permit
has been issued are permitted for the duration of construction activities on the property and
shall be removed from the property within fourteen days of the issuance of a certificate of
occupancy. Portable storage structures associated with construction are exempt from Sections
5.15.2(A) through 5.15.2(F)

5.15.3 Portable Storage Structures in Industrial Districts

The use of portable storage structures are allowed in the Industrial Districts under the following

conditions:
A, There must be no more than one portable storage structure per property_unless otherwise
approved as part of a Site Plan.
B. The portable storage structure must be no larger than ten feet wide, twenty-forty feetlong, and
10 feet high.
C. A portable storage structure shall not remain at any property in excess of4-5-consecutive-days

six (6) consecutive months unless otherwise approved as part of a site plan.-ard-shall-net-be

placed-on—any-one-property-exeess—of-90-day any-catendaryear—A-b

The portable storage structure shall be set back a minimum of 20 feet from any side or rear lot
lines, and 30 feet from any front property line.

The portable storage structure shall be set back a minimum of five feet from the nearest wall of
a building,

The portable storage structure shall be required to be placed on a paved, concrete, other
appropriate impervious surface, or be placed on blocks, and shall not obstruct any required
parking spaces on the site.

Portable storage structures associated with construction at a property where a building permit
has been issued are permitted for the duration of construction activities on the property and
shall be removed from the property within fourteen days of the issuance of a certificate of
occupancy. Portable storage structures associated with construction are exempt from Sections
5.15.3(A) through 5.15.3(F).

Zoning Ordinance, Town of Londonderry, NH - 7/22/19 Draft Page 137



Introduced: 11/25/19
Public Hearing: 12/09/19
Adopted: 12/09/19

ORDINANCE 2019-08
AN AMENDMENT TO LONDONDERRY ZONING
ORDINANCE, BUILDING CODE AMENDMENTS,
SECTION 9 REFLECTING THE ADOPTION OF THE 2015
EDITIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL CODES

WHEREAS the New Hampshire State Legislature voted for House Bill 562 for the
adoption of the 2015 editions of the international codes as promulgated by
the New Hampshire State Building Code which was signed into law by the
Governor on July 17, 2019 and became effective on September 15,2019 ;

and

WHEREAS the Londonderry Zoning Ordinance should be reflective of those changes;
and

WHEREAS the Planning Board has voted to recommend Town Council adoption of

the proposed amendments.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED by the Town Council of the Town of
Londonderry that Londonderry Zoning Ordinance, Building Code Amendments, Section 9 to be
amended to reflect the adoption of the 2015 editions of the international codes as promulgated by
the New Hampshire State Building Code. Said section of the Zoning Ordinance shall be
amended as posted.

To become effective upon passage of this Ordinance.

John Farrell, Chairman
Londonderry Town Council

A TRUE COPY ATTEST:

Town Seal

Sherry Farrell - Town Clerk
12/09/2019



TOWN OF LONDONDERRY

Building, Health & Zoning Enforcement

268 Mammoth Road
Londonderry, New Hampshire 03053
432-1100 ext. 115  Fax: 432-1128

MEMORANDUM
To: Colleen Mailloux, Town Planner
From: Richard G. Canuel, Chief Building Inspector/Zoning Administrator
Date: October 10, 2019
Subject: Proposed Zoning Amendment to update Adopted Code Editions

Language unchanged appears in Normal Text

Language omitted appears StruckThrough

New Language appears in Bold Red Italics (only those section paragraphs affected are included here)

* There are no newly proposed amendments to the Londonderry Building Regulations. The
purpose of this amendment is to update our local regulations to coincide with the
adoption of the 2015 editions of the international codes as promulgated by the NH State
Building Code.

9.1 Building Code Amendments - Part |
The International Building Code 2009 2017 5Edition as recommended and maintained by the voting membership
of the International Code Council, Inc,, with the following deletions and insertions:

P. Section 1809.7 1809.5 Frost Protection: Amend section item 1. as follows: 2. Extending below the frost line
“for the Town of Londonderry of 48" below finished grade.”

Q. Section 1809:7-1809.5 Frost Protection: Amend section exception item 2. as follows: 2. Area of 400 square
feet or less for] any accessory structure;

S. International Plumbing Code 2009 2015 - Section 106.6.2 Fee Schedule: The fees for plumbing work shall
be “in accordance with the schedule as determined by the Londonderry Town Council”

T. International Plumbing Code 2009 2015- Section 106.6.3 Fee refunds: Delete sub-section Item 2 and Item
3 entirely.

U. International Plumbing Code 2009 2415 - Section 602.3.3 Water Quality: Insert at the end of the section
paragraph, the following sentence: “A water test report shall be submitted to the Building Inspector for review
prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy. Such test shall include, “standard analysis” as recommended by
the NH Department of Environmental Services, as well as volatile organic compounds (VOC) contaminants.”

V. International Mechanical Code 2009 2015 - Section 101.1 Title: These regulations shall be known as the
Mechanical Code of the “Town of Londonderry”, hereinafter referred to as “this code”

W. International Mechanical Code 2009 2015 - Section 106.5.2 Fee schedule: The fees for mechanical work
shall be “in accordance with the schedule as determined by the Londonderry Town Council.”



Memo
October 10, 2019
Page 2

¥. International Mechanical Code 2089 2015 - Section 106.5.3 Fee refunds: Delete sub-section [tem 2 and
Item 3 entirely.

9.2 Building Code Amendments — Part II

The International Residential Code, 2009 2015 Edition as recommended and maintained by the voting membership of
the International Code Council, Inc., with the following deletions and insertions.

M. Section R113.4 Violation Penalties: Amend Section to read as follows: Omit at the end of the paragraph “by
law”, and insert the following: by the provisions of RSA 674:45 676:15 and RSA 674:17 676:17."

N. Section R114.2 Unlawful Continuance: amend Section to read as follows: omit at the end of the paragraph ”
by law”, and insert the following: by the provisions of RSA 674:15 676:15 and RSA 674+17 676:15."

0. Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria: Insert design criteria in the Table as follows:
Ground Snow Load - “It has been determined by a site-specific study conducted by the Structural Engineers of
NH that the ground snow load for Londonderry is 65 pounds per square foot.” :Wind Speed - “98 120 mph
Exposure B” Seismic Design Category - “6- “D”; Weathering - “Severe”; Frost Depth - “48"; Termite - “Moderate”;
Winter Design Temp - “-3F"; Ice Barrier Underlayment - “Yes"; Flood Hazard - “4980" “2005"; Air Freezing Index
- “1500"; Mean Annual Temperature - “45"

Q. International Plumbing Code 2009 2015 - Section 602.3.3 Water Quality: insert at the end of the Section
paragraph, the following sentence “A water test report shall be submitted to the Building Inspector for review
prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy. Such test shall include, “standard analysis” as recommended by
the NH Department of Environmental Services, as well as volatile organic compounds (VOC) contaminants.”



Memo
October 10, 2019
Page 2

¥ International Mechanical Code 2009 2015 - Section 106.5.3 Fee refunds: Delete sub-section Item 2 and
[tem 3 entirely.

9.2 Building Code Amendments — Part Il

The International Residential Code, 2009 2015 Edition as recommended and maintained by the voting membership of
the International Code Council, Inc., with the following deletions and insertions.

M. Section R113.4 Violation Penalties: Amend Section to read as follows: Omit at the end of the paragraph “by
law”, and insert the following: by the provisions of RSA 674:15 676:15 and RSA 674437 676:1 7"

N. Section R114.2 Unlawful Continuance: amend Section to read as follows: omit at the end of the paragraph “
by law”, and insert the following: by the provisions of RSA 67415 676:15 and RSA 674:47 676:15.”

0. Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria: Insert design criteria in the Table as follows:
Ground Snow Load - “It has been determined by a site-specific study conducted by the Structural Engineers of
NH that the ground snow load for Londonderry is 65 pounds per square foot.” :Wind Speed - “98 120 mph
Exposure B” Seismic Design Category - “6* “D”; Weathering - “Severe”; Frost Depth - “48"; Termite - “Moderate”;
Winter Design Temp - “-3F"; Ice Barrier Underlayment - “Yes”; Flood Hazard - “1980" “2005"; Air Freezing Index
-“1500”; Mean Annual Temperature - “45”

Q. International Plumbing Code 2609 2015 - Section 602.3.3 Water Quality: insert at the end of the Section
paragraph, the following sentence “A water test report shall be submitted to the Building Inspector for review
prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy. Such test shall include, “standard analysis” as recommended by
the NH Department of Environmental Services, as well as volatile organic compounds (VOC) contaminants.”



RESOLUTION 2019-11

A Resolution Relative to

Creating the Taxpayer Relief Act of 2020

WHEREAS

WHEREAS

WHEREAS

WHEREAS

WHEREAS

First Reading: 12/09/2019
Second Reading: Waived
Adopted: 12/09/2019

the Town of Londonderry recently went through a town-wide revaluation
that reflects significant property value increases due to market trends and
Londonderry’s desirability as a community; and

the property value increases shift the property tax burden slightly from the
commercial to the residential taxpayers, resulting in a higher than
expected property tax increase; and

the Town has prudently managed its Undesignated Fund Balance over the
last six years resulting in a current balance of over six-million dollars; and

personnel salaries and benefits of full-time employees are the largest cost
drivers of the general fund operating budget each year; and

the soon-to-be completed Central Fire Station represents the last known
major capital expense on the Town-side of government for the foreseeable
future, and because capital expenses often require bonding causing the
Town to take on additional debt;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Londonderry Town Council that it hereby
creates the Taxpayer Relief Act of 2020, enacted to provide tax relief to the property taxpayers of
Londonderry, as well as control the rate of Town-side spending, with said provisions of such

attached hereto.

John Farrell - Chairman
Town Council

(TOWN SEAL)

Sharon Farrell - Town Clerk

A TRUE COPY ATTEST:

12/09/2019



Taxpayer Relief Act of 2020

Apply one-million dollars of Undesignated Fund Balance toward reducing the tax rate
beginning in 2020 and continuing through 2024.
a. Two-hundred thousand dollars shall be applied each year over five years.
b. The only exception to this provision shall be if the UFB falls below the Town’s
recommended levels.

There shall be no new full-time personnel requests until FY2023
a. This provision shall not apply if the position(s) are funded at least 50% by an outside
revenue source beginning in FY22
b. This provision excludes retirements and/or other department reorganizations

There shall be no Town-side CIP requests prior to FY2024



